The Municipal Code of the Town of Limon

2018

400 -- ORDINANCES

410 - Ordinances Not Repealed

HISTORY: 1958 Municipal Code; amended by Ordinance No. 593 on
June 2, 2016.

410.1. The continuance in effect of temporary and/or
special ordinances and parts of ordinances, although
omitted from this Code, shall not be affected by such
omission therefrom, and the adoption of the Code shall
not repeal or amend any such ordinance or part of any
such ordinance. Among the ordinances not repealed or
amended by the adoption of this Code are ordinances:

410.1.1. Creating, opening, dedicating, naming,
renaming, vacating or closing specific streets, alleys and
other public ways.

410.1.2. Establishing the grades or lines of specific
streets, sidewalks and other public ways.

410.1.3. Authorizing or relating to specific issuances
of general obligation or special revenue bonds.

410.1.4. Creating specific sewer and paving districts
and other local improvement districts.

410.1.5. Authorizing the issuance of specific local
improvement district bonds.

410.1.6. Making special assessments for local
improvement districts and authorizing refunds from
specific local improvement district bond proceeds.

410.1.7. Annexing territory to or excluding territory
from the Town.

410.1.8. Dedicating or accepting any specific plat or
subdivision.

410.1.9. Calling or providing for a specific election.

410.1.10. Authorizing specific contracts for purchase
of beneficial use of water by the Town.

410.1.11. Approving or authorizing specific contracts
with the State, with other governmental bodies or with
others.

410.1.12. Authorizing a specific lease, sale or
purchase of property.

410.1.13. Granting rights-of-way or other rights and
privileges to specific railroad companies or other public
carriers.

410.1.14. Granting a specific gas company or other
public utility the right or privilege of constructing lines in
the streets and alleys or of otherwise using the streets
and alleys.

410.1.15. Granting a franchise to a specific public
utility company or establishing rights for or otherwise
regulating a specific public utility company.

410.1.16. Setting rates, tolls and charges for any
water, sewer, utility or proprietary fee, unless otherwise
specifically set forth in this Code.

410.1.17. Appropriating money.

410.1.18. Levying a temporary tax or fixing a
temporary tax rate.

410.1.19. Relating to salaries.
410.1.20. Amending the Official Zoning Map.

410.1.21. Creating or amending the Land
Development Code of the Town of Limon.

o
f P“
=
&/ { LA
"B;gy

411 - Use, Storage, and Sale
of Inflammable Liquids

HISTORY: Adopted November 6, 1924 by Ordinance No. 24; amended
by Ordinance No. 593 on June 2, 2016.

411.1. This code shall apply to all plants, systems,
equipment or devices hereinafter constructed or installed
within the Town of Limon for the use, handling, storage
or sale of gasoline, propane, compressed or liquefied
natural gas or other inflammable materials, and to
existing plants, systems, equipment or devices, when in
the judgment of the Town Manager the same constitutes
a menace to life or property.

411.2. It shall be unlawful for any person, firm or
corporation to keep or have in excess of fifty (50) gallons
of gasoline, propane, compressed or liquefied natural
gas or other inflammable material on any premises within
the Town of Limon.

411.2.1. The exception for Section 411.2 shall be
any commercial storage of gasoline, propane,
compressed or liquefied natural gas or other inflammable

CHAPTER 400

PAGE 93



The Municipal Code of the Town of Limon

2018

material regulated by the Colorado Division of Qil and
Public Safety under C.R.S. Title 8, Article 20 — Fuel
Products and compliant with the Town of Limon Land
Development Code.

411.3. Deleted by Ordinance No. 593 on June 2, 2016.
411.4. Deleted by Ordinance No. 593 on June 2, 2016.
411.5. Deleted by Ordinance No. 593 on June 2, 2016.

411.6. By special permission of the Town Manager or
manager’s designee, temporary storage tanks above the
ground may be permitted in sparsely populated sections
of the town but not within two hundred feet of any
buildings except those used in connection therewith.

411.7. The drawing of inflammable liquids from tank cars
shall not be permitted at any location where in the
judgment of the Town Manager or the manager’s
designee such operation would be unsafe to life and
property. The person or firm to whom such tank cars are
consigned shall empty such cars within a period of
twelve hours, and shall complete the emptying within
twenty-fours hours from the time such tank cars are
placed in possession for unloading.

411.8. Deleted by Ordinance No. 593 on June 2, 2016.
411.9. Deleted by Ordinance No. 593 on June 2, 2016.
411.10. Deleted by Ordinance No. 593 on June 2, 2016.

411.11. Each tank delivery truck, semitrailer, or truck
trailer for bulk storage shall be regulated by Colorado
Division of Oil and Public Safety under C.R.S. Title 8,
Article 20 — Fuel Products and/or other state and federal
regulations.

411.12. Oil burners and systems for domestic heating in
stoves and furnaces shall not be used or installed unless
installed in accordance with the current fire code adopted
by the Town of Limon and approved by the National Fire
Protection Association, and such standards are hereby
made a part of the requirements of this code.

411.13. No dry-cleaning establishment or automobile
garage, repair shop or other business using or keeping
on hand at any one-time gasoline or other highly volatile
inflammable liquids in quantities exceeding five gallons
shall hereafter be allowed in any building which is
occupied above the first floor as a place of public
assemblage, or as a factory employing over five persons,
or as a hotel, rooming house or for dwelling purposes.

411.14. Any person, firm or corporation who shall violate
any provision of this code shall, upon conviction, be fined
in a sum of not less than twenty ($20.00) nor more than
five hundred dollars ($500.00) for each offense.

™ ¢
% /%
"7# iy
&’ e
b

412 - Sale and Use of Fireworks

HISTORY: Adopted August 3, 1939 by Ordinance No. 107; amended
completely on June 27, 2002 by Ordinance No. 474

412.1. DEFINITIONS. The following words shall have
the stated meanings for purposes of this Code:

412.1.1. Display retailer: any person licensed with
the State of Colorado pursuant to Title 12, Article 28, of
the Colorado Revised Statutes, and given the authority to
store and/or sell fireworks.

412.1.2. Fireworks: any article, device, or
substance prepared for the primary purpose of
producing a visual or auditory sensation by combustion,
explosion, deflagration, or detonation which meets the
description of fireworks as set forth in the United States
Department of Transportation Hazardous Materials
Regulations, Title 49, Code of Federal Regulations, Parts
173.88 and 173.100. "Fireworks" does not include toy
caps which do not contain more than twenty five
hundredths of a grain of explosive compound per cap,
highway flares, railroad fuses, ship distress signals,
smoke candles, and other emergency signal devices, or
educational rockets, toy propellant device type engines
used in such rockets when such rockets are of
nonmetallic construction and utilize replaceable engines
or model cartridges containing less than two ounces of
propellant and when such engines or model cartridges
designed to be ignited by electrical means, or fireworks
which are used in testing or research by a licensed
explosive laboratory.

412.1.3. Permissible Fireworks: means the
following items designed primarily to produce visual or
audible effects by combustion, including certain devices
designed to produce audible or visual effects, except that
no device or component shall, upon functioning, project
or disburse any metal, glass, or brittle plastic fragments:

412.1.3.1. Cylindrical fountains, total pyrotechnic
composition not to exceed seventy-five grams each in
weight. The inside diameter shall not exceed three-
quarters of one inch.

CHAPTER 400

PAGE 94



The Municipal Code of the Town of Limon

2018

412.1.3.2. Cone fountains, total pyrotechnic
composition not to exceed fifty grams each in weight.

412.1.3.3. Wheels, total pyrotechnic composition
not to exceed sixty grams for each driver unit or two
hundred forty grams for each complete wheel. The
inside tube diameter of driver units shall not exceed one-
half of one inch.

412.1.3.4. Ground spinner, a small device
containing not more than twenty grams of pyrotechnic
composition venting out of an orifice usually in the side of
the tube, similar in operation to a wheel, but intended to
be placed flat on the ground.

412.1.3.5. llluminating torches and colored fire in
any form, total pyrotechnic composition not to exceed
one hundred grams each in weight.

412.1.3.6. Dipped sticks and sparklers, the total
pyrotechnic composition of which does not exceed one
hundred grams, of which the composition of any chlorate
or perchlorate shall not exceed five grams.

412.1.3.7. Explosive auto alarms, as described in
Title 49, code of federal regulations, part 173.100.

412.1.3.8. Toy propellant devices and toy smoke
devices, as described in Title 49, code of federal
regulations, part 173.100.

412.1.3.9. Cigarette loads, as described in Title
49, code of federal regulations, part 173.100.

412.1.3.10. Trick matches, consisting of book
matches, strike-any-where matches, or strike-on-box
matches, as described in Title 49, code of federal
regulations, part 173.100.

412.1.3.11. Trick noise makers, as described in
Title 49, code of federal regulations, part 173.100.

412.1.3.12. Snake or glow worm, pressed pellets
of pyrotechnic composition that produce a large snake-
like ash upon burning.

412.1.3.13. Novelties consisting of two or more
devices enumerated in this Section 412.1.3.

412.1.4. Person: an individual, partnership, firm,
company, business, association, corporation, or
governmental entity.

412.2. UNLAWFUL USE OR SALE OF FIREWORKS.
Except as provided for in this Code, the following is
declared to be unlawful and punishable as set forth
herein:

412.2.1. No person shall sell, offer for sale, expose
for sale, possess with intent to sell, import, export, or
store fireworks or permissible fireworks unless and until
such person has been appropriately licensed by the
State of Colorado pursuant to the provision of Title 12
Article 28 of the Colorado Revised Statutes. Such
license and/ or permit shall be appropriately displayed at
the person's place of business with all required state
notices and warnings.

412.2.2. It shall be unlawful for any person who is
under sixteen years of age to purchase any fireworks,
including those defined as permissible fireworks.
However, at all times that it is lawful for any person over
the age of sixteen years to possess and discharge
permissible fireworks, it shall also be lawful for a person
under the age of sixteen years to possess and discharge
permissible fireworks, if such person is under adult
supervision.

412.2.3. Except as set forth in Section 412.3. it shall
be unlawful for any person to possess or discharge any
fireworks, other than permissible fireworks.

412.2.4. Section 412.2. shall not be construed so as
to prevent the use of fireworks by railroads or other
transportation agencies for signal purposes or
illumination, or the use of blank cartridges for a show,
theatrical production, or for ceremonial purposes in
athletic or sporting events, or use by military
organizations. Further this section shall not be construed
to prevent the sale, purchase, possession, or use of
fireworks distributed by the division of wildlife for
agricultural purposes under condition approved by the
division or the sale, delivery, consignment, gift, or
furnishing of fireworks among display retailers,
wholesalers, or exporters licensed under the laws of this
state.

412.3. PERMITTED DISPLAY AND USE OF
FIREWORKS. As allowed by state statute, the Town or
its authorized agent or agents, is authorized to store and
use fireworks at scheduled public events, including but
not limited to Independence Day celebrations, and to
adopt such reasonable rules and regulations as may be
necessary for the safety of the citizens and property.
Further, the Town, retains the power to grant non-
transferable and non-assignable permits within the Town
limits for the use and display of fireworks by any person,
fair association, amusement park, or other similar
organizations or groups, provided that such person or

CHAPTER 400

PAGE 95



The Municipal Code of the Town of Limon

2018

entity complies with any and all reasonable rules and
regulations that may be imposed by the Town as a
condition for the granting of such permit.

412.4. EMERGENCY PROHIBITION OF THE USE OF
FIREWORKS AND PERMISSIBLE FIREWORKS BY
RESOLUTION. In the event that the Governor of the
State of Colorado, State Legislature, or other local, state,
or federal governmental entity, endowed with decision
making authority concerning the use of fireworks or
permissible fireworks, or in the event that the Town
Board, due to dry weather conditions, or other factors
which through the danger of fire present a health and
safety concern to the citizens and property of the Town,
determine that a total prohibition of the use, sale, and
possession of fireworks and permissible fireworks is
necessary and required, then the Board through
emergency Resolution, may prohibit the use, sale, and
possession of fireworks for such time and under such
conditions as the Board deems necessary for the health,
safety, and welfare of its citizens and property.

412.5. PENALTY. Any person found to have violated
the terms of this Section 412 shall be subject to a fine in
an amount not to exceed Five Hundred Dollars ($500.00)
per occurrence. In addition, the Municipal Court Judge
may require restitution and costs from the violator in an
amount sufficient to cover any damage or injury caused
by the unauthorized use, sale, or possession of fireworks
or permitted fireworks.

K"ﬁf’x
(Y 2\
\ 7

413 - Closing Hours for Pool Halls

HISTORY: Adopted February 6, 1941 by Ordinance No. 110. Deleted in
its entirety on October 6, 1994 by Ordinance No. 380

A
/f‘éﬁv |
\ 1

%& J/:d

414 - Garbage Tax

HISTORY: Adopted April 5, 1951 by Ordinance No. 135. Deleted in its
entirety on October 8, 1994 by Ordinance No. 380

AL T‘R
[ %V
\ 7
%a vcd

415 - Licensing and Regulating
Coin Operated Amusements

HISTORY: Adopted March 15, 1957 by Ordinance No. 160. Deleted in
its entirety on June 1, 1995 by Ordinance No. 388.

™ ¢
\ /%
&7 i ! 3
J

@E

420 - Historical Numbered Designations of
Ordinances

Section 420 precedes the ordinance number below only
in this section for documentation and organizational
purposes. The second number is the actual ordinance
number passed by the Town Board of Trustees, since
The Town Board’s first meeting held on December 30",
1909; if data is available. In the documentation of bond
issues parenthesis represent the computed maturity

dates and brackets represent the actual retired date,
again, if data is available.

420.1. Rules and Orders of Business; December 30",
1909

420.2. Rules and Orders of Business: January 13%,
1910.

420.3. Relating to Officers, Appointments, Duties, and
Compensation: January 13, 1910

420.4. Board of Trustees — Yeas & Nays: January 13,
1910

420.5. Related to Licenses: January 27, 1910
420.6. Relating to Misdemeanors: January 20, 1910

420.7. Relating to Police Magistrates Court: February 3,
1910

420.8. Relating to Dogs: February 11, 1910
420.9. Relating to Animals: February 11, 1910
420.10. Appropriating the Funds: March 31, 1910

420.11. Licensing & Regulating Real Estate Brokers:
April 28, 1910

420.12. Repealing Ordinance No. 11: May 12, 1910

420.13. Calling of Special Election for Constructing a
Waterworks System: July 14, 1910

420.14. Not Available

CHAPTER 400

PAGE 96



The Municipal Code of the Town of Limon

2018

420.15. Grant Certain Privileges to Colorado Telephone
Company: August 4, 1910

420.16. Issuing of Bonds for Waterworks For Fire &
Domestic; October 1, 1910

420.17. Issuing of Bonds for Construction of
Waterworks: January 1, 1911

420.18. Fixing Rates for Water Supply: May 4, 1911

420.19. Appropriating Funds starting April 1, 1912;
March 30, 1912

420.20. Granting Albert Jahl to Construct & Operate
Electric Light & Power: December 26, 1912

420.21. Special Election for Ordinance 20: December
26, 1912

420.22. Creating the Office of City Inspector to Inspect
Electric Wiring: January 23, 1913

420.23. Appropriating Funds: March 28, 1913

420.24. Public Health & Sanitation Regulations: May
2nd, 1913

420.24. Duplicate# -Appropriating Funds for 1914 Fiscal
Year: March 31st, 1914

420.25. Granting a Franchise to Walter Weem (Not
Executed.

420.26. Appropriating Funds: March 25, 1915

420.27. Creation of Limon Sewer District No. 1 and
Bonds.: April 23, 1915

420.28. Concerning Sewer in Sewer District No. 1:
September 16, 1915

420.29. Fixing Rates for Water Supplied: February 10,
1916

420.30. Approving Cost of Sewer District No. 1;: March
4,1916

420.31. Appropriating Funds for April 15t 1916: March 4,
1916

420.32. Issuing Bonds for Construction Improvements &
Extension of Waterworks: March 4, 1916

420.33. Fixing License Fees: January 4, 1917

420.34. Amending Part of Ordinance No. 32: January 4,
1917

420.35. Appropriating Funds: March 1, 1917
420.36. Creating Office of City Inspector: August 2, 1917

420.37. Establishing Rates of Electric Service:
December 6, 1917

420.38. Related to Construction of Sidewalks: June 6,
1918

420.39. Appropriating Funds Beginning April 15, 1919:
April 12, 1919

420.40. Amending Ordinance No. 18 — Water Tap Fee:
May 17, 1919

420.41. Limon Water Bonds 1919: July 1, 1919
420.42. Limon Water Bonds 1919: July 1, 1919

420.43. Funding Bonds for Outstanding Debt: April 1,
1920

420.43 > . Appropriating Funds for Fiscal year beginning
April 18, 1920: February 5, 1920

420.44. Regulation of Traffic: August 9, 1920
420.45.
420.46.

420.47. Negotiable Coupon Bonds - Refunding
Waterwork Bonds: December 1, 1920

420.48. Fixing License Fees: December 1, 1921
420.49. Providing for Fire Limits: February 2, 1922
420.50. Relating to Dogs: February 2, 1922

Relating to Misdemeanors: September 2, 1920
Relating to Dogs: November 4, 1920

420.51. Issuing & Selling of Coupon Bonds: August 1,
1922

420.52. Establishing Rates for Electric Service:
September 7, 1922

420.53. & 420.54. Special Election — Sale of Old
Pumphouse Property: September 7, 1922

420.55. Appropriating Funds Beginning April 15t, 1923:
November 2, 1922

420.56. Not Available
420.57. Not Available
420.58. Not Available
420.59. Not Available
420.60. Not Available
420.61. Not Available

420.62. Issuing Bonds for Erecting a Public Building:
April 5, 1923

420.63. Not Available
420.64. Vacating a Portion of Second Street.

CHAPTER 400

PAGE 97



The Municipal Code of the Town of Limon

2018

420.65. Establishing Street Grade and Elevations; July
5, 1923.

420.66. Appropriating Funds Beginning April 1, 1924:
November 1, 1923

420.67. Fixing Water Rates: August 7, 1924

420.68. Use, Storage, and Sale of Inflammable Liquids:
November 6™, 1924.

420.69. Establishing Salary for Mayor: March 5, 1925

420.69. Duplicate # - Appropriating Funds for 1926
Fiscal Year: November 5, 1925.

420.70. Establishing Salary for Board of Trustees:
March 5, 1925

420.71. Purchase of Engine for Light & Water Plant:
January 21, 1926

420.72. Extension of Sidewalk on E Avenue: March 4,
1926

420.73. Appropriate Funds for 1927 Fiscal Year:
November 4, 1926

420.74. Election to Sell the Power Plant to
Commonwealth Utilities: February 28, 1927

420.75. Commonwealth Utilities Right to Operate Power
Plant: May 6, 1927

420.76. Appropriate Funds for 1929 Fiscal Year:
October 4, 1928

420.77. Regulating Traffic Upon Public Streets:
November 6, 1928

420.78. Defining & Fixing of Fire Limits: August 1, 1929

420.79. Appropriating Funds for 1930 Fiscal Year:
November 7, 1929

420.80. Relating to Intoxicating Liquor: August 7, 1930
420.81. Not Available

420.82. Appropriating Funds for 1931 Fiscal Year:
November 6, 1930

420.83. Owners of Real Estate must Construct
Sidewalk: November 15, 1930

420.84. Relating to Snow and Ice on Sidewalks: January
2,1931

420.85. Vacating Certain Streets: June 4, 1931

420.86. Unlawful to Attach Anything to Power Poles:
September 4, 1931

420.87. Relating to Production & Sale of Milk in Town
Limits: November 1931

420.88. Appropriating Funds for 1932 Fiscal Year:
January 7, 1932

420.89. Appropriating Funds for 1933 Fiscal Year:
November 3, 1932

420.90. Relating to Production and Sale of Milk & Cream:
December 1, 1932

420.91. Appropriating Funds for 1934 Fiscal Year:
October 5, 1933

420.92. Improvements to Waterworks: May 14, 1934:
May 14, 1934

420.93. Regulate the Use of Streets: June 2, 1934

420.94. Selling of Waterworks Coupon Bonds: June 7,
1934

420.95. Creation of Limon Special Improvement District
No. 2.

420.96. Cost of Special Improvement District No. 2:
September 7, 1934

420.97. Amending Ordinance 93 — Use of Streets:
September 6, 1934

420.98. Appropriating Funds for 1935 Fiscal Year:
October 4, 1934

420.99. Appropriating Funds for 1936 Fiscal Year:
November 7, 1935

420.100. Appropriating Funds for 1937 Fiscal Year:
October 1, 1936

420.101. Establishing on Curb & Sidewalk Grade on
Main Street: March 23, 1937

420.102. Necessity of Construction of Curb & Sidewalk:
June 3, 1937

420.103. Appropriating Funds for 1938 Fiscal Year:
October 7, 1937

420.104. Assessing the Cost of Construction of
Sidewalk: December 2, 1937

420.105. Franchise - Mountain States T. and T. Co.:
June 3, 1938

420.106. Appropriating Funds for 1939 Fiscal Year:
October 6, 1938

420.107. Sale and Use of Fireworks: August 3, 1939.

420.108. Appropriating Funds for 1940 Fiscal Year:
October 5, 1939

420.109. Appropriating Funds for 1941 Fiscal Year:
October 4, 1940

CHAPTER 400

PAGE 98



The Municipal Code of the Town of Limon

2018

420.110. Closing Hours for Pool Halls: February 6™,
1941. Repealed by Ordinance No. 380.

420.111. Appropriating Funds for 1942 Fiscal Year:
October 2, 1941

420.112. Relating to Civilian Defense: June 1942

420.113. Appropriating Funds for 1943 Fiscal Year:
November 6, 1942

420.114. Appropriating Funds for 1944 Fiscal Year:
420.115. Appropriating Funds for 1945 Fiscal Year:
420.116. Appropriating Funds for 1946 Fiscal Year:

420.117. Submission of a Vote for Acquiring Land for an
Airport: February 26, 1946

420.118. Establishment of a Sinking Fund fpr Purchase
of Street Lights: March 1946

420.119. Appropriating Funds for 1947 Fiscal Year:
October 4, 1946

420.120. Airport Bonds: 1947

420.121. Increasing the 1947 Budget, Cancelling
Ordinance 119: November 14, 1946

420.122. Water Bonds; $18,000: May, 1966.

420.123. Gas Line Franchise - Loran L. Laughlin: April
151, 1947.

420.124. Appropriating Funds for 1948 Fiscal Year:
October 27, 1947

420.125. Regulating Traffic of Bicycles on Public
Streets: November 6, 1947.

420.126. Franchise - Mountain View Electric
Association.

420.127. Providing Fire Protection & Creating Fire
Department: April 1, 1948.

420.128. Water Rates: June 3, 1948.

420.129. Appropriating Funds for 1949 Fiscal Year:
October 8, 1948.

420.130. Water Bonds; $10,000: 1960.

420.131. Appropriating Funds for 1950 Fiscal Year:
October 6, 1949

420.132. Defining of Garbage, Rubbish & Waste Matter:
December 1, 1949.

420.133. Appropriating Funds for 1951 Fiscal Year:
October 13, 1950

420.134. Water Bonds; $20,000: 1966.

420.135. Garbage Tax: April 5™, 1951. Repealed by
Ordinance No. 246 & 380.

420.136. Vacating Certain Streets; May 3", 1951.
420.137. Vacating Certain Alley; May 39, 1951.
420.138. Social Security Benefits: July 5, 1951

420.139. Appropriating Funds for 1952 Fiscal Year:
October 1951

420.140. Water Bonds; $20,000: 1962.

420.141. Licensing the Business of Selling Cigarettes:
August 7, 1952.

420.142. Appropriating Funds for 1953 Fiscal Year:
October 2, 1952

420.143. Regulating Operation of Coin Operated
Amusement Games: May 1, 1952

420.144. Water Rates: August 6, 1953
420.145. Annexation of Land; October 1t , 1953.
420.146. Annexation of Land: October 15t, 1953.

420.147. Appropriating Funds for 1954 fiscal Year:
October 12, 1953

420,148. Appropriating Funds for 1955 Fiscal Year:
October 12, 1954

420.149. Water Bonds: $80,000: 1955.

420.150. Appropriating Funds for 1956 Fiscal Year:
October 6, 1955

420.151. Penalties for Non-Payment of Water Usage:
February 9, 1956

420.152. Franchise - Bender Community TV Company:
March 18, 1956.

420.153. Bonds. Public Park; February 6, 1956
420.154. Bonds, Water; $50,000: 1972.
420.155. Bonds, Pool; $35,000: 1970.

420.156. Election for Funding Legal Floating
Indebtedness: May 31, 1956.

420.157. Bonds, Pool; $15,000: 1971.
420.158. Appropriating Funds for 1957 Fiscal Year:

420.159. Water Rates, Amending Ordinance 144:
October 8, 1956

420.160. Licensing and Regulating Coin Operated
Amusements: March 15™, 1957. Repealed by Ordinance
No. 388.

CHAPTER 400

PAGE 99



The Municipal Code of the Town of Limon

2018

420.161. Public Library: May 6%, 1957.

420.162. Public Cemetery: May 6™, 1957.
420.163. Annexation of Land; June 17, 1957.
420.164. Annexation of Land; August 29", 1957.

420.164. Duplicate # - Correction to legal description of
8/29/57 Annexation; December 121", 1957.

420.165. Not Used

420.166. Adoption of Model Traffic Code: Repealed by
Ordinance No. 182.

420.167. Adoption of Municipal Code of 1958: April 37,
1958.

420.168. Coin Operated Games: June 10", 1958.
420.169. Sewer Rental Charges: July 7, 1958.
420.170. Prohibiting Nuisances; July 28", 1958.
420.171. Sewer Regulations; August 215!, 1958.
420.172. Budget Year 1959: October 9™, 1958.
420.173 Budget Year 1960: October 8", 1959.

420.174. Sewer Revenue Bonds for Sewage Lagoon;
$14,000.00: May 25™, 1960. (July 15", 1974)

420.175. Budget Year 1961: November 3", 1960.

420.176. Solicitors & Canvassers: November 3, 1960.
Repealed by Ordinance No. 196.

420.177. Sell Town Property: March 215t 1961.
Repealed by Ordinance No. 339.

420.178. Budget Year 1962: November 2™, 1961.
420.179. Sell Town Property: December 71", 1961.
420.180. Water Rates: June 215, 1962.

420.181. Budget Year 1963: October 4%, 1962.

420.182. Model Traffic Code: March 7, 1963.
Repealed by Ordinance No. 201.

420.183. Baskett Heights Annexation: August 12,
1963.

420.184. Budget Year 1964: October 3, 1963.
420.185. Circle Lane Annexation: April 2"9, 1964.
420.186. Budget Year 1965: October 15t, 1964.

420.187. Police Magistrate, Fees: May 6™, 1965.
Repealed in its entirety by Ordinance No. 375.

420.188. Building Zone Code and Map: June 3", 1965.

420.189. Playground Agreement: July 15t, 1965.
420.PHA1. Planning Commission: July 15t, 1965.
420.190. Budget Year 1966: October 71", 1965.
420.191. Building Zone Amendment: March 3,1 966.

420.192. Code Amendment — Trailer: March 3, 1966.
Repealed by Ordinance No. 376.

420.193. First Baskett Hills Annexation: June 10™, 1966.
420.194. Building Code Amendment: August 4", 1966.
420.195. Dog Amendment: September 15t, 1966.
420.196. Canvassers & Solicitors: September 1st, 1966.
420.197. Budget Year 1967: October 6th, 1966.
420.198. Mountain View Franchise: January 5th, 1967.

420.199. Plateau Natural Gas Franchise: April 6th,
1967. Repealed by Ordinance No. 318.

420.200. Budget Year 1968: October 5th, 1967.

420.201. Model Traffic Code: March 14th, 1968.
Repealed by Ordinance No. 217.

420.202. Dogs Vaccination & License: April 11th, 1968.
420.203. Warner Addition Annexation: July 9th, 1968.
420.204. Land Sale: September 5th, 1968.

420.205. Budget Year 1969: October 3rd, 1968.

420.206. Telephone Business and Occupation Tax:
November 7th, 1968.

420.207. Speed Limits: April 3rd, 1969. Repealed by
Ordinance No. 217.

420.208. Budget Year 1970: October 2nd, 1969.
420.209. Peace Officers: November 6th, 1969.
420.210. Water Rates: November 6th, 1969.

420.211.
1970.

420.212. Raines Addition Annexation: March 17th, 1970.
420.213. Budget Year 1971: November 5th, 1971.
420.214. Budget Year 1972: October 7th, 1971.

420.215. Four Year Overlapping Terms for Trustees and
Four-Year Terms for Mayor: December 2nd, 1971.

Highway Department Property: January 2nd,

420.216. Control of Refuse and Disposal Site: January
6th, 1972.

CHAPTER 400

PAGE 100



The Municipal Code of the Town of Limon

2018

420.217. Model Traffic Code: January 6th, 1972.
Repealed by Ordinance No. 229.

420.218. Fireman’s Pension: January 6th, 1972.

420.219. Police Pension: January 6th, 1972. Repealed
in its entirety by Ordinance No. 380.

420.220. Water Rates Amendment: October 5th, 1972.
420.221. Sewer Rates Amendment: October 5th, 1972.
420.222. Budget year 1973: October 5th, 1972.

420.223. Cigarette Tax: October 9th, 1972. Repealed
by Ordinance No. 227.

420.224. Mobile Home Park License Fee: December
7th, 1972.

420.225. Vern's TV Cable Franchise: May 3rd, 1973.

420.226. Municipal Building Bond; $125,000: May 16th,
1973. (May 1st, 1981)

420.227. Repeal Multiple Ordinances: June 7th, 1973.
420.228. Budget Year 1974: October 4th, 1973.

420.229. Model Traffic Code: March 7th, 1974.
Repealed by Ordinance No. 247.

420.230. Acquiring Golf Course: March 7th, 1974,

420.231. Golf Course Bonds; $225,000: March 7th,
1974. (January 1st, 2014) [December 3rd, 2009]

420.232. Building Zones: October 3rd, 1974.
420.233. Budget Year 1975: October 3rd, 1974.

420.234. Duties of Chief of Police and Town
Superintendent: April 3rd, 1975.

420.235. Town Dump Charges: August 7, 1975.
Repealed by Ordinance No. 282.

420.236. Budget Year 1976: October 2nd, 1975.

420.237. Baskett Annexation: March 4th, 1976;
rerecorded March 17th, 1994.

420.238. Land Sale/Nall: May 6th, 1976.

420.239. Hours for Irrigation: August 16th, 1976.
Repealed by Ordinance No. 271.

420.240. Budget Year 1977: October 26th, 1976.

420.241. Telephone Business and Occupation Tax:
October 7th, 1976.

420.242. Increase Cable Rates/Vern’s TV: December
3rd, 1976.

420.243. Water Rates: June 2nd, 1977.

420.244. Budget Year 1978: October 26th, 1977.
420.245. Sewer Rates: December 1st, 1977.

420.246. Repeal Ordinance 135 Water Rates:
December 1st, 1977.

420.247. Model Traffic Code: February 2nd, 1978.

420.248. Water Bonds 1978; $1,625,000: March 9th,
1978. (December 15th, 2003)

420.248A. Water Bonds; Amend Ordinance 248: March
20t 1978.

420.249. Packard Property Sale: March 7th, 1978.
420.250. Beer and Liquor Code Fees: May 4th, 1978.
420.251. Sales Tax/Personal Property: July 27th, 1978.

420.252. Sewer Revenue Bonds; $395,000: October
26th, 1978. (November 1st, 1998)

420.253. Budget Year 1979: November 2nd, 1978.
420.254. Budget Year 1979: November 2nd, 1978.

420.255. Repeal Ordinance No. 219: November 28th,
1978.

420.256. Traffic Regulation: February 1st, 1979.

420.257. Model Energy Efficiency Construction: March
2nd, 1979.

420.258. Amend Ordinance No. 188 & 232 Zoning: April
5th, 1979.

420.259. Amend Ordinance No. 251, Sales Tax
Exemptions Use Tax Collection: July 5th, 1979.

420.260. Water Bonds; $785,000: November 1st, 1979.
(July 1st, 2020) [March 2nd, 1989]

420.261. Water Bonds; $631,000: November 1st, 1979.
(July 1st, 2020) [March 2nd, 1989]

420.262. Water Bonds; $320,000: November 1st, 1979.
(December 17th, 2009)

420.263. Water Rates: November 1st, 1979.
420.264. Budget Year 1980: November 1st, 1979.
420.265. Budget Year 1980: November 1st, 1979.

420.266. Amend Ordinance No. 262: December 6th,
1979.

420.267. Amend Ordinance No. 261, Water Bond
Amounts and Due Dates: February 7th, 1980.

420.268. Budget Year 1981: November 6th, 1980.
420.269. Budget Year 1981: November 6th, 1980.

CHAPTER 400

PAGE 101



The Municipal Code of the Town of Limon

2018

420.270. Amend Ordinance No. 188, 232, & 258,
Zoning: Tabled February 5th, 1981.

420.271. Repeal Ordinance No. 239: May 7th, 1981.

420.272. Amend Ordinance No. 167 & 246, Water
Connection Permits: May 7th, 1981.

420.273. Amend Ordinance No. 171 & 245, Sewer
Connection Permits: May 71, 1981.

420.274. Amend No. 188 & 232, Rezone: July 2nd,
1981.

420.275. Vacating Street: August 6th, 1981.
420.276. Vacating Alleyway: August 6th, 1981.

420.277. Raines Second Addition Annexation:
September 3rd, 1981.

420.278. Amend Ordinance No. 202, Dogs: October 1st,
1981. Repealed by Ordinance No. 299.

420.279. Amend No. 167, Livestock: November 5th,
1981. Repealed by Ordinance No. 376.

420.280. Budget Year 1982: November 5th, 1981.
420.281. Budget Year 1982: November 5th, 1981.

420.282. Repeal Ordinance No. 235, Dump Charges:
January 7th, 1982.

420.283.
420.284.
420.285.
420.286.

420.287. Special Assessment Bonds; $75,000: August
5th, 1982. (September 1st, 2002)

420.288. Budget Year 1983: December 2nd, 1982.
420.289. Budget Year 1983: December 2nd, 1982.

Special Improvement District: May 6th, 1982.
Street Vacating: April 1st, 1982.

Water Bill Delinquent Notice: April 1st, 1982.
Refusal of Lots for Park: June 3rd, 1982.

420.290. Hazardous Response Authority: December
2nd, 1982.

420.291. Regulating Wind Powered Electricity —
Generating Equipment: January 6th, 1983.

420.292. Prohibiting Disposal of Hazardous Waste Upon
Property in Town: January 6th, 1983.

420.293. Cost Recovery Agreement: May 5th, 1983.
Repealed by Ordinance No. 376.

420.294. Refuse Collection Service Rates: February 3rd,
1983.

420.295. Amend Ordinance No. 171, Special
Improvement District 1982-1: February 3rd, 1983.

420.296. Special Improvement District Costs: April 7th,
1983.

420.297. Vacating Portion of N Avenue: May 5th, 1983.
420.298. Vern’'s TV Cable Franchise: August 4th, 1983.

420.299. Amend Ordinance No. 202, Dogs,
Vaccinations & Repeal Ordinance No. 278: September
1st, 1983.

420.300. A Curative Ordinance to Cure and Validate the
Defective Enactment of Ordinance No. 279: October 6th,
1983. Repealed by Ordinance No. 376.

420.301. Amend Ordinance No. 167, Disturb the Peace:
October 6th, 1983.

420.302. Budget Year 1984: December 1st, 1983.
420.303. Budget Year 1984: December 1st, 1983.

420.304. Amend Ordinance No. 247, Traffic Regulation:
February 2nd, 1984.

420.305. Amend Ordinance No. 298, Cable TV Charges:
May 3rd, 1984.

420.306. Flood Ordinance: October 4th, 1984.
420.307. Heavy Vehicle Route: February 7th, 1984.

420.308. Cable Transfer to Cripple Creek Cable:
December 6th, 1984.

420.309. Amend Ordinance No. 188, Building Zones:
December 6th, 1984.

420.310. Budget Year 1985: December 27th, 1984.
420.311. Budget Year 1985: December 27th, 1984.

420.312. Amend Ordinance No. 221, 294, Billing for
Sewer, Refuse Collection and Use of Dump: February
7th, 1985.

420.313. Lease Agreement for Town Shop from JINCO
Leasing: October 3rd, 1985.

420.314. Budget Year 1986: December 30th, 1985.
420.315. Budget Year 1986: December 30th, 1985.

420.316. Amend Ordinance No. 167, Water Rates: May
1st, 1986.

420.317. Amend Ordinance No. 167 & 312, Sewer
Rates: May 1st, 1986.

420.318. Peoples Natural Gas Franchise: November
6th, 1986.

420.319. Amend Ordinance No. 167, Municipal Court:
November 6th, 1986.

CHAPTER 400

PAGE 102



The Municipal Code of the Town of Limon

2018

420.320. Street, Curb, Gutter Improvements on Ninth
Street: November 6th, 1986.

420.321. Budget Year 1987: December 30, 1986.
420.322. Budget Year 1987: December 30, 1986.
420.323. Budget Year 1988: November 19th, 1987.
420.324. Budget Year 1988: November 19th, 1987.

420.325. Cable TV Transfer/Televents: December 3rd,
1987.

420.326. Amend Ordinance No. 167, Municipal Code:
December 3rd, 1987.

420.327. Street, Curb, Gutter Improvements on Ninth
Street: March 3rd, 1988.

420.328. Lease for Loader: June 2nd, 1988.
420.329. Curfew: November 3rd, 1988.

420.330. Amend Ordinance No. 306, Flood: November
3rd, 1988.

420.331. Revenue Bonds 1988, $5,000,000: November
22nd, 1988. (December 10th, 2008)

420.332. Budget Year 1989: November 28th, 1988.
420.333. Budget Year 1989: November 28th, 1988.

420.334. Easement for Road to Treatment Plant:
February 2nd, 1989.

420.335. Amend Ordinance No. 216, Refuse Collection
Service and Use of Town Disposal Site: February 2nd,
1989.

420.336. Cable Transfer/Vantage Cable: January 5th,
1989.

420.337. Water Bond Refunding Ordinance No. 260,
261 and 267; $592,000: March 2nd, 1989. (July 1st,
2010) [July 7th, 1994]

420.338. Budget Year 1990: November 27th, 1989.

420.339. Limon Wastewater Treatment System: June
14th, 1989.

420.340. Budget Year 1990: November 27, 1989.
420.341. Vacating P Avenue: December 7th, 1989.

420.342. Water, Sewer Improvements: March 8th, 1990.

420.343. Building Contractor Registration: June 11th,
1990. Repealed by Ordinance No. 404.

420.344. Uniform Building Code: June 26th, 1990.
Repealed by Ordinance No. 367.

420.345. Emergency Telephone Service Agreement:
December, 1990.

420.346. Amend Ordinance No. 306, Flood: November
15th, 1990.

420.347. Budget Year 1991: December 6th, 1990.
420.348. Budget Year 1991: December 6th, 1990.

420.349. Construction of Town Hall, Streetscape:
January 17th, 1991.

420.350. Water, Sewer Improvements: March 7th, 1991.

420.351. Vacating Portion of 2nd Avenue: May 2nd,
1991.

420.352. Amend Ordinance No. 188 & 232, Rezone:
June 17th, 1991.

420.353. Amend Ordinance No. 188 & 232, Rezone:
July 11th, 1991.

420.354. Town Hall Project Lease: October 25th, 1991.
420.355. Budget Year 1992: December 12th, 1991.
420.356. Budget Year 1992: December 12th, 1991.

420.357. Arboriculture/Line of Sight: December 12th,
1991.

420.358. Weeds: February 13th, 1992. Repealed and
replaced by Ordinance No. 476.

420.359. Property Sale: March 5th, 1992.

420.360. Write-In Candidate, Election Cancellation: April
9th, 1992.

420.361. Mountain View Franchise: June 4th, 1992.
420.362. Unclaimed Property: Jun 25th, 1992.

420.363. Authorizing Colorado Water Series 1992:
Bond; $228,300: August 6th, 1992. (June 1st, 2002)
[May 4th, 2000]

420.364. Franchise Application Fee: November 5th,
1992.

420.365. Property Taxes for 1993: December 12th,
1992.

420.366. Budget Year 1993: December 12th, 1992.
420.367. Building Codes: February 4th, 1993.
420.368. Traffic Regulation: February 4th, 1993.
420.369. Vantage Cable Franchise: August 5th, 1993.
420.370. Refuse Collection Rates: August 5th, 1993.

CHAPTER 400

PAGE 103



The Municipal Code of the Town of Limon

2018

420.371. Codification, Municipal Code: December 2nd,
1993.

420.372.
420.373.
420.374.
420.375.

420.376. Land Development Code & Official Zoning
Map: June 2nd, 1994.

420.377. Water Refunding Bonds Payment Series 1994;
$1,490,000: July 7th, 1994. (September 1st, 2005)
[December 6th, 2001]

420.378. Junk Vehicles & Junkyards: July 7th, 1994,
420.379. Amend Ordinance No. 378: August 4th, 1994.

420.380. Amend Sections of Municipal Code: October
6th, 1994.

Budget Year 1994: December 9th, 1993.
Property Taxes for 1994: December 9th, 1993.
Cemetery Board: March 3rd, 1994.

Municipal Court: March 3rd, 1994.

420.381. Charges for Wastewater Service: December
1st, 1994.

420.382. Budget Year 1995: December 1st, 1994.
420.383. Property Taxes 1995: December 1st, 1994.

420.384. Galaxy Telecom Cable Transfer: December
1st, 1994.

420.385. Amend Section 521, Junk, Junked Vehicles
and Junkyards: February 2nd, 1995.

420.386. Boards & Commissions: April 6th, 1995.
420.387. Grazing Lease: May 4th, 1995.

420.388. Deleting Licensing and Regulating Coin
Operated Amusements: June 1st, 1995.

420.389. Lease Agreement for Pre-school: June 1st,
1995.

420.390. Drainage Flows: July 6th, 1995.

420.391. Emergency Response Authority Hazardous
Materials Incidents: August 3rd, 1995.

420.392. Airport Land Contract: November 2nd, 1995.
420.393. Model Traffic Code: December 7th, 1995.
420.394. Budget Year 1996: December 7th, 1995.

420.395. Amending Sales & Use Tax: January 4th,
1996.

420.396. Vacating a Portion of 9th Street: June 6th,
1996.

420.397. Amend Junk, Junked Vehicles and Junkyards:
May 2nd, 1996.

420.398. Amend Municipal Code Regarding Duties of
Appointed Officers: June 6th, 1996.

420.399. Curfew for Minors: June 6th, 1996.

420.400. Angle Parking: August 1st, 1996.

420.401. Amending Sales & Use Tax: August 1st, 1996.
420.402. Daily Park Hours: August 1st, 1996.

420.403. Uniform Building Code: August 1st, 1996.
420.404. Building Contractors: October 3rd, 1996.
420.405. Street Names & Numbers: October 3rd, 1996.
420.406.
420.407.
420.408.

420.409.
1996.

420.410.
420.411.
420.412.

420.413. Lease Agreement for Library and Morgan
Community College: April 3rd, 1997.

420.414. Amend Municipal Code Regarding Penalty
Assessment Notices, and Points: August 14th, 1997.

420.415. Board of Adjustments: September 4th, 1997.

420.416. Land Development Code Change: October
2nd, 1997.

Tree Trimmers: November 7th, 1996.
Budget Year 1997: December 5th, 1996.
Water Rate Increase: December 5th, 1996.

Junk Vehicles & Junkyard: December 5th,

Fire Department Pensions: January 2nd, 1997.
Land Development Code: January 2nd, 1997.
Out of Town Water Usage: April 3rd, 1997.

420.417. Lease Agreement with Pre-school: October
2nd, 1997.

420.418. Amend Zoning Map: November 6th, 1997.

420.419. Market Place Annexation: November 6th,
1997.

420.420. Coleman Annexation: November 17th, 1997.
420.421. Budget Year 1998: December 4th, 1997.

420.422. Sale of Property to Ben F. Parmer: May 6th,
1998.

420.423. Amend Angle Parking: September 3rd, 1998.

420.424. Amend Section 200 of Municipal Code
Concerning Emergency Services: October 23rd, 1998.

CHAPTER 400

PAGE 104



The Municipal Code of the Town of Limon

2018

420.425. Amend Section 135 of Municipal Code — Water
Department Water Rate Change: November 5th, 1998.

420.426. Amend Section 638 of Municipal Code — Angle
Parking: November 5th, 1998.

420.427. Budget Year 1999: December 3rd, 1998.
420.428. Amend Heavy Vehicle Route: May 4th, 1999.
420.429. Prohibit Oil Drilling City Limits: May 4th, 1999.

420.430. Moratorium — Adult Entertainment: July 1st,
1999.

420.431. Amend Municipal Code, Water, Sewer, Trash:
July 1st, 1999.

420.432. Feedlot Bond: ($585,000). July 20th, 1999.
(December 31st, 1999).

420.433. Sexually Oriented Business Licensing:
November 1999.

420.434. Change Municipal Code — Sewer Department:
December 2nd, 1999.

420.435. Change Municipal Code — Trash Rates:
December 2nd, 1999.

420.436. Change Mayor & Trustee Salary: December
2nd, 1999.

420.437. Budget Year 2000: December 2nd, 1999.

420.438. Feedlot Bond; $620,000: December 2nd, 1999.
(December 12th, 2012)

420.439. Amend Curfew: March 7th, 2000.
420.440. Blair Property Exchange: March 7th, 2000.

420.441. Lease Agreement with Limon Heritage Society:
April 6th, 2000.

420.442. Establishing Town of Limon Activity Enterprise:
April 6th, 2000. Repealed by Ordinance No. 482.

420.443. Establishing Town of Limon Sewer Activity
Enterprise: April 6th, 2000. Repealed by Ordinance No.
482.

420.444. Formally Establishing Recreation Facilities
Enterprise: April 6th, 2000.

420.445. Formally Establishing Airport Fuel Activity
Enterprise: April 6th, 2000.

420.446. Formally Establishing Ambulance Activity
Enterprise: April 6th, 2000.

420.447. Grazing Lease with Wayne Shade: April 6th,
2000.

420.448. Water Loan between Colorado Water
Resources and Town: Bond 2000; $1,440,808.84,
Refunding Ordinance No. 363: May 4th, 2000.

420.449. Amend Ordinance No. 376, Require
Residences to Have Front Door Facing Street: May 9th,
2000.

420.450. Amend Ordinance No. 376, Notice of Public
Hearing Requirements: May 9th, 2000.

420.451. Amend Ordinance No. 376, Public Notice
Requirements: May 9th, 2000.

420.452. Amend Ordinance No. 376, Zoning Map: May
9th, 2000.

420.453. Amend Ordinance No. 376, Zoning Map: May
9th, 2000.

420.454. Amend Ordinance No. 376, Zoning Map: May
9th, 2000.

420.455. Amend Ordinance No. 376, Public Notice
Requirement: July 6th, 2000.

420.456. Amend Municipal Code — Town Dump
Regulations: September 7th, 2000.

420.457. Amend Ordinance No. 376, Defining Sexually
Oriented Business: July 6th, 2000.

420.458. Contract to Sell Real Estate with Robert J. &
Ellen E. Safranek: November 2nd, 2000.

420.459. Amend Ordinance No. 376, Allow Fire Station
as Conditional Use: December 7th, 2000.

420.460. Amend Ordinance No. 376, Zoning Map:
December 7th, 2000.

420.461. Budget Year 2001: December 7th, 2000.

420.462. Water Activity Enterprise: December 26th,
2000.

420.463. Adopt Uniform Building Code: May 3rd, 2001.
Repealed by Ordinance No. 521.

420.464. Manufactured Housing: August 2nd, 2001.

420.465. Big Sandy Addition Annexation: September
6th, 2001.

420.466. Big Sandy No. 2 Addition Annexation: October
4th, 2001.

420.467. Budget Year 2002: December 6th, 2001.

420.468. Water Bonds Series 2001 Refunding
Ordinance 377: December 6th, 2001.

420.469. Election for Special Assessment Bonds:
February 4th, 2002.

CHAPTER 400

PAGE 105



The Municipal Code of the Town of Limon

2018

420.470. Lease Agreement with Fort Morgan
Community College: February 4th, 2002.

420.471. Amend Ordinance No. 135, Water Department
Service Connection Fees: May 2nd, 2002.

420.472. Amend Ordinance No. 135, Crawlspaces in
Residential Construction: June 6th, 2002.

420.473. Dangerous Dogs: June 6th, 2002. Repealed
by Ordinance No. 520.

420.474. Fireworks: June 27th, 2002.

420.475. Street, Curb, Gutter Improvements: Special
Improvement District No. 1: September 5th, 2002.

420.476. Noxious Weeds: July 11th, 2002.

420.477. Amend Code/Duties of Town Administrator,
Town Clerk/Treasurer and Town Attorney: July 11th,
2002.

420.478. Prohibit Tobacco Products by Minor:
November 7th, 2002.

420.479. Amend Land Development Code — Prohibit
Manufactured Housing in Commercial & Industrial
Districts Other Than Temporary Use: November 7th,
2002.

420.480. Amend Code/Non-Domestic Pretreatment:
March 6th, 2003.

420.481. Budget Year 2003: December 5th, 2002.

420.482. Utility Activity Enterprise: Repealed Ordinance
No. 442 & 443. December 5th, 2002.

420.483. Amend Ordinance No. 376, Development
Requirements for Residential Zone Districts, Street Width
Requirements: May 1st, 2003.

420.484. Vacate Unused Dedicated Streets and
Roadways: July 3rd, 2003.

420.485. Model Traffic Code: September 4th, 2003.

420.486. Amend Code/Non-Domestic Pretreatment:
October 9th, 2003.

420.487. Budget Year 2004: December 4th, 2003.

420.488. Amend Code/Pershing Memorial Cemetery:
December 29th, 2003.

420.489. Special Improvement District 2004 — 1
Election: February 5th, 2004.

420.490. Lease Agreement with Gerald Shalosky at
Airport: May 6th, 2004.

420.491. Water Revenue Improvement Bonds;
$2,600,000: May 6th, 2004. (2044).

420.492. Creation of Special Improvement District 2004
—1: July 1st, 2004.

420.493. Fire Station Lease Purchase: September 2nd,
2004.

420.494. Ballot Question Limon Special Improvement
District 2004 — 1: November 16th, 2004.

420.495. Budget Year 2005: December 2nd, 2004.

420.496. Bonds — Limon Special Improvement District
2004 — 1: Bond 2004 — 1 ($200,000). December 2nd,
2004. (July 1st, 2024).

420.497. Amend Land Development Code — Sexually
Oriented Business: January 6th, 2005.

420.498. Repeal Ordinance 433; Add Chapter 760:
January 6th, 2005.

420.499. Amend Land Development Code Accessory
Buildings: January 6th, 2005.

420.500. Contracts, Purchases in Ordinance No. 376:
March 3rd, 2005.

420.501. Grazing Lease: May 5th, 2005.

420.502. Carla’s Cluster Care Economic Development
Agreement: July 7th, 2005.

420.503. Right of Way Ordinance: July 7th, 2005

420.504. Special District Ballot Question 2005 — 2A
($185,000): August 4th, 2005.

420.505. Special District Ballot Question 2005 — 2B
($38,000): August 4th, 2005.

420.506. Special District Ballot Question 2005 — 2C
($252,000): August 4th, 2005.

420.507. Real Property Sale to Michael & Trudy
O’Dwyer: August 4th, 2005.

420.508. Real Property Sale to Geneva Rogers: August
4th, 2005.

420.509. Special District 2005 — 2A, 2—5 — 2B, 2005 —
2C: November 17th, 2005.

420.510. Special District 2005 — 2A, 2—5 — 2B, 2005 —
2C: November 17th, 2005.

420.511. Budget Year 2006: December 6th, 2005.

420.512. Bonds for Special Districts: Bond 2005 — 2A;
$185,000, Bond 2005 — 2B; $38,000, Bond 2005 — 2C;
$252,000, Bond Total of $475,000; not to exceed
$415,000. December 6th, 2005. (July 1st, 2025).

420.513. Amend Section 636 — Traffic Regulation:
February 6th, 2006.

CHAPTER 400

PAGE 106



The Municipal Code of the Town of Limon

2018

420.514. Amend Section 155 — Non-Domestic Pre-
treatment: March 6th, 2006.

420.515. Lease for Library with Morgan Community
College: June 8th, 2006.

420.516. Amend Ordinance No. 376, Pertaining to
Business Signs: September 7th, 2006.

420.517. Budget for 2007: December 7th, 2006.

420.518. Airport Grazing Lease with Tim Daum:
February 1st, 2007.

420.519. Aquila Franchise: repealed and replaced
Ordinance No. 318, April 5th, 2007.

420.520. Amend Section 531 — Pertaining to Dogs:
repealed and replaced Ordinance 473, September 6th,
2007.

420.520. Duplicate Number * Service Support with
Medtronic: June 7th, 2007.

420.521. Amend Section 513 — Uniform Building Code:
January 3rd, 2008. Repealed Ordinance No. 463.

420.522. Budget Year 2008: December 6th, 2007.
420.523. Bulk Water Sales: March 6th, 2008.

420.524. Morgan Community College Lease: June 5th,
2008.

420.525. Model Traffic Code: October 2nd, 2008.
420.526. Budget Year 2009: December 4th, 2008.

420.527. Water, Sewer Trash Rates: December 4th,
2008.

420.528. Town Officers: February 5th, 2009.

420.529. Amend Land Development Code — Mobile
Home Parks: August 6th, 2009.

420.530. Amend Land Development Code — Mobile
Home Zone Uses: August 6th, 2009.

420.531. Multi-Year Service Support Agreement with
Medtronic dba Physio Controls: August 6th, 2009.

420.532. Amend Section 134, Utility Service Billing:
November 5th, 2009. August 6th, 2009.

420.533. Temporary Moratorium — Medical Marijuana:
November 5th, 2009 & expires 180 days later.

420.534. Budget Year 2010: December 3rd, 2009.
420.535. Utility Rate Increase: December 3rd, 2009.

420.536. Temporary Moratorium — Medical Marijuana
Grow Facilities: February 4th, 2010.

420.537. Temporary Moratorium Extension — Medical
Marijuana; see Ordinance No. 533 & 536: April 1st, 2010.

420.538. Amend Ordinance No. 371 by Changing Titles
for Town Administrator and Public Works Director to
Town Manager: May 6th, 2010.

420.539. Morgan Community College Lease Agreement;
Fourth Amendment: June 3rd, 2010.

420.540. Town Owned Land (by Airport) Grazing Lease:
June 3rd, 2010.

420.541. Medical Marijuana Prohibition to the Land
Development Code: October 7th, 2010.

420.542. FAA No Cost Airport No Cost Land Lease
Agreement: October 7th, 2010.

420.543. Budget Year 2011: December 2", 2010.

420.544. Amending Land Development Code Regarding
Zoning Map for Lot 1, Block 3 of Weeks Subdivision to
Highway Commercial (CH-1) Zone District: May 5th,
2011.

420.545. Amending Land Development Code Regarding
Title of Town Manager, May 5th, 2011.

420.546. Concerning the Certification of Delinquent
Charges and Assessment to County Treasurer for
Collection, May 5%, 2011.

420.547. Annexing the Limon Golf Course Addition,
June 30", 2011.

420.548. Concerning Self-Contained Compaction Units
(SCU) and Sub-Section (5) Roll-Off Containers, July 7,
2011.

420.549. Concerning the Drilling and Pumping of Crude
Oil, Natural Gas, or Other Crude Petroleum, October 6",
2011.

420.550. Budget Year 2012, December 1°t, 2011.

420.551. Establishing Fees for Surface Water,
December 15, 2011.

420.552. Concerning Grazing Lease for a 13-Acre
Parcel at the Limon Municipal Airport, February 2,
2012.

420.553. Concerning First Amendment to the Lease
Agreement with Morgan Community College, March 1%,
2012.

420.554. Concerning Regulation of Transient Sales,
June 7, 2012.

420.555. Concerning Water Bond Refinancing, June 7%,
2012.

CHAPTER 400

PAGE 107



The Municipal Code of the Town of Limon

2018

420.556. Concerning Sales Tax Exemptions for Non-
Profits, July 5, 2012.

420.557. Amending Chapter 532 — Pertaining to
Livestock and Fowl, September 61", 2012.

420.558. Amending Chapter 531 — Pertaining to Dogs,
September 6%, 2012.

420.559. Annexing the Limon Municipal Airport Addition,
November 81", 2012.

420.560. Concerning Disturbing the Peace; Using
Offensive Language, November 1%t, 2012.

420.561. Budget Year 2013, December 6%, 2012.

420.562. Prohibiting the Operation of Marijuana
Facilities or Retail Marijuana Stores, March 7, 2013.

420.563. Adopting Regulations Establishing a Cross
Connection Control Program, July 9™, 2013.

420.564. Considering a Permanent Easement for Tri-
State Generation and Transmission Association, Inc.,
September 5%, 2013.

420.565. Considering Public Health and Imposing
Penalties and Costs for Allowing a Dangerous Building,
November 7%, 2013.

420.566. Budget Year 2014, December 5, 2013.

420.567. Amending the Municipal Code and Land
Development Code Regarding Flood Plain Regulations,
January 2", 2014.

420.568. Amending the Municipal Code and Land
Development Code Regarding Oil and Gas Facilities,
January 2", 2014.

420.569. Amending the Land Development Code by
Inserting a New Section 202.3.13 — Commercial District
(C-1), January 2™, 2014.

420.570. Amending Certain Subsections of Chapter 360
— Pershing Memorial Cemetery, March 6", 2014.

420.571. Second Amendment to the Lease Agreement
with Morgan Community College, May 1%, 2014.

420.572. Amending the Official Zoning Map for the Big
Sandy Addition from Open Space — Recreation Zone
District (OS-R) to Commercial Zone District (C-1), April
31, 2014.

420.573. Amending the Official Zoning Map for the
Limon Municipal Airport Addition from Light Industrial
Zone District (LI) to Commercial Zone District (C-1), April
31, 2014.

420.574. Sale of Certain Real Property Within the Limon
Golf Course Addition, May 1%t, 2014. (Not Executed)

420.575. Concerning a Lease of Certain Irrigation Water
Rights to Frasier Farms, Assigning Agreement to River
Bend Ranch, LLC, May 1%, 2014.

420.576. Amending Chapter 531 — Pertaining to Dogs
Regarding Release of Dogs, July 10", 2014.

420.577. Amending Ordinance No. 367, Modernization
of Limon Municipal Code Chapter 100, November 6™,
2014.

420.578. Amending Ordinance No. 367, Modernization
of Limon Municipal Code Chapter 200, December 4™,
2014.

420.579. Budget Year 2015, December 4, 2014.

420.580. Amending Ordinance No. 367, concerning
Section 531, Dogs, February 5™, 2015

420.581. Grazing Lease for Property at the Limon
Municipal Airport, February 5", 2015

420.582. Amending Ordinance No. 367, Modernization
of Limon Municipal Code Chapter 300, April 2", 2015.

420.583. Amending Ordinance No. 367 Adding
Subsection 138.5 Concerning Foreign Trade Zone Board
to Chapter 138 — Board and Commissions, July 2", 2015

420.584. Amending Ordinance No. 367, Modernization
of Limon Municipal Code Chapter 500, October 1%, 2015

420.585. Budget Year 2016, December 3, 2015

420.586. Amending Ordinance No. 371 by Amending
Chapter 135, Water and Sewer Rates, December 3™,
2015

420.587. Amending Ordinance No. 360 Regarding
Election Regulations, January 7%, 2016.

420.588. Amending Ordinance No. 367, Modernization
of Limon Municipal Code Chapter 600: February 4,
2016.

420.589. Amending Chapter 200 of Land Development
Code: March 3, 2016

420.590. Amending Municipal Code, Chapter 636 —
Traffic Regulations: April 71, 2016

420.591. Amending Ordinance No. 367, Modernization
of Limon Municipal Code Chapter 700: April 7™, 2016

420.592. Morgan Community College Lease Agreement:
May 5%, 2016.

420.593. Amending Ordinance No. 367, Modernization
of Limon Municipal Code Chapter 400: June 2™, 2016.

420.594. Property Lease Agreement with Harlow Farms,
LLC, June 29, 2016.

CHAPTER 400

PAGE 108



The Municipal Code of the Town of Limon

2018

420.596. Budget Year 2017, December 15, 2016

420.597. Grazing Lease for Property at the Limon
Municipal Airport, February 2", 2017

420.598. Approving Lease Agreement with Lincoln
County for Space in Library, February 2", 2017

420.599. Amending Municipal Code, Chapter 636 —
Repealing Traffic Regulations; February 2", 2017

420.600. Approving a Water Lease Agreement with Pine
Bluffs Sand and Gravel; February 2nd, 2017

420.601. Amending Chapter 200 of Land Development
Code; March 2", 2017

420.602. Approving Franchise Agreement with Mountain
View Electric Association; August 3", 2017

420.603. Amending Chapter 200 of Land Development
Code; May 4, 2017

420.604. Approving Economic Development Incentive
Agreement with Lincoln Hospitality LLC, June 1%, 2017

420.605. Approving a Property Lease for Grain Storage
with NORAG on a 1.38-Acre Parcel at the Big Sandy
Addition, June 13t, 2017

420.606. Amending the Official Zoning Map of The Town
of Limon and Changing the Zone District on All of Blocks
1,7, 8,9 And 10 And Lots 1-6 Of Block 11 of the
Nuttings East Addition of the Town of Limon; July 6™,
2017

420.607. Amending Chapters 100 and 200 of Land
Development Code, July 6™, 2017

420.608. Approving an Economic Development
Incentive Agreement with Oasis Hospitality LLC, August
31,2017

420.609. Amending Chapters 100, 200 and 500 of Land
Development Code; October 5, 2017

420.610. Budget Year 2018, December 7%, 2017

420.611. Amending Ordinance No. 371 by Amending
Chapter 137, Water Sewer Rates, December 7%, 2017

420.612. Approving an Economic Development
Incentive Agreement with Project Badger (Wausau),
January 4%, 2018

420.613. Setting Ballot Titles and Ballot Content to
Implement the Town’s Grand Plan By Authorizing (I) A
Sales and Use Tax Rate Increase and (li) The Issuance
ff Revenue Bonds to Finance Capital Improvements;
Submitting the Ballot Issues at the Election To Be Held
April 3, 2018, February 1%, 2018

420.614. Submitting for Election the Re-Establishing
Local Authority That Has Been Restricted by the
Colorado General Assembly Since 2005 by Title 29,
Article 27 of the Colorado Revised Statutes, to Provide
"Advanced Services" (High-Speed Internet),
"Telecommunications Services" and "Cable Services",
February 1%, 2018

420.615. Amending the Land Development Code of the
Town of Limon adopted by Ordinance 376 By Annexing
the State Highway 40 Addition to the Town of Limon with
a Zone District Designation of Commercial District (C-1),
and Open Space (OS) and Approving the Statement of
Annexation, October 4™, 2018

420.616. Approving a Development Incentive Agreement
with Richard and Donna Metcalf (Recipient) for the
Chisolm Estates Project, October 4, 2018

420.617. Budget Year 2019, December 6, 2018

CHAPTER 400

PAGE 109



